From: Keonya Jackson <kejackson94@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 12, 2020 10:31 PM

To: Susan Tumey

Subject:Re: Available receipts from 3326 Indiana Ave
Attachments: Screenshot_20200812-222639 Messages.jpg

| will send a photo of the letter you as well and | am going to attempt to write her and hope she returns
to me but | am not holding my breath for it and by the end of the month | might have some more receipts
for my repairs/renovations. But | am available for the board meeting as well. Thank you all!

-Keonya Jackson

On Wed, Aug 12, 2020, 4:10 PM Susan Tumey <stumey@edckc.com> wrote:
Ms. Jackson,

Dan Moye, the director of the LCRA, advises that we will need to get authorization from our Board to grant
the exemption. Are you available between 9:30 a.m. and noon via video or teleconference for our next
Board meeting on Wednesday, August 26, 2020? You wouldn’t have to be available during the entire
time, just during the Board’s discussion regarding the exemption. LCRA staff plans to recommend that
you receive the exemption.

Can you provide any documentation from Ms. Crawford, showing her refusal to communicate with or
provide you with receipts demonstrating the work done on the house prior to your ownership? Or any
other communication from Ms. Crawford regarding the property? Please provide the additional
documentation by noon on Wednesday, August 19.

If you have any questions, please let me know.

SUSAN TUMEY
Administrative Assistant for Chapter 353
+ Land Clearance for Redevelopment Authority

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION OF KANSAS CITY
300 Wyandotte | Suite 400 | Kansas City, MO | 64105
d: 816.691.2106 | www.edckc.com
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Yeah | just talked to
him, he is reaching
out to you tOday 11:14 AM

He just called!

Thank you!

11:15 AM

Monday, August 10, 2020

4 Seller said she put
her return address
on the letter, that's
basically how she
would prefer for you
toreachouttoher ..



Diamond Safety & Consultation MOLD

OSHA License # 38-0079490
REMEDIATIO

Anthony Crowder

P.O. Bo x

Kansas Gity, MO N INVOICE
64134

Phone: 816-701-9214

E-mail: sales@diamonddesignbuild.org

Invoice # 1231 Date: June 30, 2020

Bill to

C & J Realty Investment
3326 Indiana Ave
Kansas City, MO 64128

Description Amount

1.Apply an EPA registered antimicrobial antifung_a_l disinfectant to affected areas ‘

within the interior. = n |
'x

2. Removal of affected Basement Installation in basement ceiling.
3. Bag and Dispose.
4. Clean, scrub and disinfect affected areas within basement with an EP
antimicrobial/antifungal disinfectant.
5. Spray newly exposed areas in interior with an EPA registered
antimicrobial/antifungal disinfectant.

6. HEPA vacuum surfaces to remove dead spores.
7. Encapsulate newly exposed, affected beams in the bas

A registered

ement to prevent the return

of mold growth. |
8. All work has been done in strict accordance with all applicable regulations, standards, L
and codes. \

Subtotal | $120000 |

Tax / VAT r
TOTAL | $1,200.00

Report Number 006241/ License # 38-0079490

Thank you for your business!




Ky Wg/o/u & /ecutc

s e N &5 o7
7 1o/ &6 /12
2 \}%471/543 éﬁ Wl

T e A | 5524 vdiawa

=S e | e sl GhlE7
Xemo  Bp1o7

YOUR WORK ORDER RO. OUR BID NO.

Contractors Invoice

DESCRIPTION OF WORK PERFORMED

)
4. ’éma{)p /4—// ﬁ/dé and ’//-afp AOU’(/L;? 7%’0/%_,

affic  _sposte

jgéﬂ?ﬁe 5,&//. Ll Corcude kil ims. ,@/

woh and Talie -—&(Jznf—/y

faw ddoo _lome s 4o % llie % j@/
/ Zm//oofﬂ-y /447{ //us ant fweéder ,442% Y 2aci

S

/
/
/

> . TA ) 5 V.
e methdk  ltor i mateen (s,

Material is guaranteed to i
be as specified, and the above work was performed in accordanchwi and specifications provided for the al

K
and was CWM in a sub rkmanlike manner for the agreed sum of / “)"/ (4

| B G
' _,_50 ,‘f____ A R ____Dollars ($_ / pe 59 ).
sisa [ IPartial (\JFaMinvoice due and payable by: TL_,L \, C( B‘DQ\L
iccordance with our Agreement [ ]P o i - | i
e (]Proposal No. o Dated Y
: Month by Year



Work Order/invoice
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